
 
 
 
 

LILY GIRL PAPER WEBSITE TEMPLATE + 
DESIGN CUSTOMIZATION AGREEMENT 

 
 

Please read the following carefully. By purchasing this template you acknowledge that 
you agree with the terms of this contract. 

 
I understand that I am purchasing a website template with design customization, meaning I will 
provide my own logos/images, text, links, etc. to Amber Jones and she will import these items 
into my website template. Amber will provide me with a Google form where I will plug in the text 
and URLs for each section of the website. I will send my images via Dropbox or Google Drive, 
and I will name them as is shown on my Google form so that she can easily place them 
correctly.  
 
I agree to send all required content (logos, text, images) to Amber within 14 days of purchase. 
Once received, customization will be completed by Amber within 14 business days. Any delays 
in providing these materials may result in extended turnaround times and additional fees to 
customize after the 14 day period.  
 
I understand the time spent on these customizations will not exceed 3 hours. If it appears 
additional time will be necessary, Amber will notify me at the 2 hour mark. I can choose to 
modify my requested changes, or pay an hourly fee of $85 after the 3 hour mark has been 
passed. (3 hours is more than enough time for the vast majority of customers.) 
 
The customization package includes text, image, color and link changes to the template as it is 
currently displayed. It does not include changes to the layout or structure of the site. After 
completion of the first round of edits, Amber will send the link to the new site for me to review. 
One round of minor revisions (text, images, color updates) will be allowed with this package, 
and those revisions must be provided to Amber within one week of the proof being sent. 
Additional revision requests will be billed at $85 per hour. 
 
I acknowledge that only the items shown on the sample website are included in the price of my 
template. The customization package does not include email marketing set-up, blog pages, 
stores, and other such pages. 
 
I understand and acknowledge that Amber will offer me basic support for 14 days after the final 
site design has been approved; however, more in-depth questions and support, or assistance 
needed after the initial 14-day period, will be billed at $85 per hour.  
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I understand that all images currently serving as placeholders on the website template belong to 
Amber Jones and must be replaced with my own images.  

 
I acknowledge that the price of the template does not include my domain name registration 
and/or upgrading the site on Wix to a Premium subscription which will remove the small Wix ad 
banner from the top of the site. I understand that if I am not ready to pay for a website, I can 
keep the free Wix site with the ad in place, and understand that the URL will be 
siteprefix.wixsite.com/siteaddress; I am aware that I can change the site prefix and site address; 
i.e. lilygirlpaper.wixsite.com/lilygirlpaper.  

 
I understand that this template cannot be imported into an existing website. If I have an existing 
site I acknowledge that I will need to copy and paste text and images from the original website 
to this new template. 

 
I understand that after completion of the design, Amber will transfer the site to me via Wix using 
the email address provided at checkout. **Please set up a Wix account using this email address 
for seamless transfer. Wix will notify me once the transfer has been initiated and I acknowledge 
that Wix requires me to accept the transfer invitation within 3 days. If I fail to do so, I will contact 
Amber to transfer the site again at a fee of $15.  

 
I understand that this template is not one-of-a-kind and will be resold again and again to other 
customers. 
 
I understand this template is licensed for personal and business use only. It may not be resold, 
distributed, or claimed as an original design. The structure and design remain the intellectual 
property of Lily Girl Paper. 

 
I understand that this template can only be used on the Wix.com platform. 

 
I acknowledge that website templates are non-refundable and all sales are final. 
 
I understand that once the website is transferred, Lily Girl Paper is not responsible for any 
issues arising from customer modifications, accidental deletions, or site malfunctions. Wix 
provides its own support for technical issues beyond template functionality. 
(https://support.wix.com/en/article/contacting-wix-customer-care-for-support) 
 
 

By purchasing this template you acknowledge that you agree with the 
terms of this contract. 
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